

THE STEWART LAW FIRM, P.C.

The Stewart Law Firm, P.C.

INVOICE

1224 Centre West Drive
Suite 400A
Springfield, IL 62704
US
rick@thestewartlawfirm.com
O: 2172998116

| | |
|------------|------------------|
| Number | 156 |
| Issue Date | 8/20/2021 |
| Due Date | 8/20/2021 |
| Email | sc540@scso87.org |

Bill To:

Shelby County Sheriff

301 East Main Street
Shelby, Illinois 62565
O: 217-774-3941

Time Entries

| Time Entries | Billed By | Rate | Hours | Sub |
|--|-------------------|----------|-------|------------|
| Time 8/10/2021 Conference call with Sheriff re negotiation of twelve hour shifts and necessary changes to the collective bargaining agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.50 | \$125.00 |
| Time 8/10/2021 Email to M. Russillo re engagement to negotiate memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.25 | \$62.50 |
| Time 8/11/2021 Conference call with M. Russillo re memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.75 | \$187.50 |
| Time 8/11/2021 Review collective bargaining agreement for changes to be made relating to 12 hour shifts | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.75 | \$187.50 |
| Time 8/12/2021 Draft Memorandum of Agreement re twelve hour shifts | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 5.00 | \$1,250.00 |
| Time 8/12/2021 Conference calls with Sheriff re terms of memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.50 | \$125.00 |
| Time 8/12/2021 Attend County Board meeting and meet with FOP to discuss pay issues related to change to twelve hour shifts | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 2.75 | \$687.50 |

| Time Entries | Billed By | Rate | Hours | Sub |
|---|-------------------|----------|-------|----------|
| Time 8/13/2021 Draft cost of the wages, holidays and sick leave conversion | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 1.50 | \$375.00 |
| Time 8/13/2021 Conference call M. Russillo re memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.50 | \$125.00 |
| Time 8/13/2021 Conference call S. McQueen re memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 1.25 | \$312.50 |
| Time 8/13/2021 Conference call with N. Kroncke re draft memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.25 | \$62.50 |
| Time 8/16/2021 Conference call with S. McQueen | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.25 | \$62.50 |
| Time 8/16/2021 Revise memorandum of agreement per conversation with Sheriff; email memorandum of agreement to FOP | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 1.00 | \$250.00 |
| Time 8/16/2021 Conference calls with M. Russillo re memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.50 | \$125.00 |
| Time 8/16/2021 Review and respond to email from M. Russillo re suggested revisions to memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.75 | \$187.50 |
| Time 8/16/2021 Conference calls with S. McQueen re overtime pay proposal of union | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.50 | \$125.00 |
| Time 8/17/2021 Conference calls with S. McQueen re proposed memorandum of agreement and overtime | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 1.25 | \$312.50 |
| Time 8/17/2021 Draft revised memorandum of agreement in response to union's concerns | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 2.25 | \$562.50 |
| Time 8/17/2021 Conference call with S. McQueen and assistant state's attorney re memorandum of agreement and overtime pay | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.75 | \$187.50 |
| Time 8/17/2021 Review and revise FOP's proposed memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 1.25 | \$312.50 |
| Time 8/17/2021 Conference call with N. Kroncke, asst. state's attorney, M. Russillo, J. Wood, and S. McQueen to finalize memorandum of agreement | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 0.50 | \$125.00 |

| Time Entries | Billed By | Rate | Hours | Sub |
|---|-------------------|----------|--------------|-------------------|
| Time 8/19/2021 Conference calls with S. McQueen; revise memorandum of agreement; review and respond to email from M. Russillo; conference call with N. Kroncke | Richard V Stewart | \$250.00 | 1.50 | \$375.00 |
| Time Entries Total | | | 24.50 | \$6,125.00 |

Expenses

| Expense | Billed By | Price | Qty | Sub |
|---|-------------------|--------|---------------|----------------|
| Out-of-town travel 8/12/2021 Travel to and from meeting of Shelby County Board Meeting | Richard V Stewart | \$0.56 | 124.00 | \$69.44 |
| Expenses Total: | | | 124.00 | \$69.44 |

| | |
|--------------------------|-------------------|
| Total (USD) | \$6,194.44 |
| Paid | \$0.00 |
| Balance | \$6,194.44 |
| Total Outstanding | \$6,194.44 |