

# FRANCZEK RADELET

ATTORNEYS & COUNSELORS

300 SOUTH WACKER DRIVE, SUITE 3400 | CHICAGO, IL 60606

FEIN 36-3924177

T: 312.986.0300 | F: 312.986.9192 | WWW.FRANCZEK.COM

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL / ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGED

Invoice Date: April 27, 2015

Invoice No. 160634

Client No. 02352

Robert L. Breuder  
President  
Board of Trustees for the College of DuPage  
College of DuPage  
425 Fawell Blvd  
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

For Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2015

Total Professional Fees	\$55,372.00
Total Costs Advanced and Expenses Incurred	\$51,464.63
<b>CURRENT INVOICE DUE</b>	<b><u>\$106,836.63</u></b>

THIS INVOICE IS PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT.

PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE.





# RES PUBLICA GROUP

444 N. Michigan Avenue, Ste 3600  
Chicago, IL 60611 (312) 755-3535

---

---

## INVOICE

---

---

Mr. Respicio F. Vazquez  
FranczekRadelet  
300 South Wacker Drive  
Suite 3400  
Chicago, IL 60606

Invoice No.: 9425  
Date: April 23, 2015

### Invoice Summary

Total for services rendered	\$51,200.00
Total expenses	\$0.00
<b>Balance Due</b>	<b>\$51,200.00</b>

Please Remit To:  
Res Publica Group, 444 N. Michigan Ave., Ste 3600, Chicago, IL 60611



444 N. Michigan Avenue, Ste. 3600  
Chicago, IL 60611 (312) 755-3535

**Timekeeper Summary**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
G. Chipparoni, President & CEO	25.25	\$6,762.50
M. Childers, SC	3.00	\$750.00
L. Trafficanta-Lesniak, VP	14.50	\$3,625.00
S. Patterson, VP	31.00	\$7,750.00
<b>J. Matyas, Senior Consultant</b>	<b>74.00</b>	<b>\$18,812.50</b>
A. Mesirov, SMD	0.50	\$125.00
K.Taylor Stanford, SAE	53.50	\$13,375.00
<b>Totals</b>	<b>201.75</b>	<b>\$51,200.00</b>

**Professional Services**

<b>3/2/2015</b>	JM	Consult with counsel on research and strategies <b>regarding FOIA requests about COD foundation</b> . Correspondence with counsel about additional material needed to prepare media strategy.	2.50
	KTS	Conversation with counsel to discuss strategy and next steps	1.00
	GJC	Consult with counsel, internal w/ T.S and J.M. prep; <b>meeting at RPG w/ E. Birt</b> and R. Vazquez; follow-up with team; follow-up w/ counsel	<b>3.00</b>
<b>3/3/2015</b>	JM	Consult with counsel on strategies about COD's announcement canceling candidate forum. <b>Correspondence with counsel requesting information about the COD foundation</b> in anticipation of Tribune stories.	<b>4.50</b>

3/3/2015	KTS	Consult with counsel on research on Board of Trustees; communication with counsel on requests for information.	2.50
	GJC	Consult with counsel on internal re: <b>memo to the board from E. Birt; follow-up with E. Birt</b> and R. Vazquez	<b>2.00</b>
3/5/2015	<b>JM</b>	Consult with counsel on responding to legislative request for an audit. Strategy regarding use of COD property for a candidate forum. Numerous conversations with counsel.	3.50
	KTS	Correspondence/call with counsel to discuss upcoming events at the College and media interest.	2.00
	GJC	call to R. Vazquez re: board; internal prep and follow-up w/ T.S. and <b>J.M.</b>	2.00
3/6/2015	<b>JM</b>	Consult with counsel on correspondence regarding legislative audit request and drafted of statement for the media. Conference call with counsel and <b>research on FOIA issues</b> . Discussed with counsel upcoming student event with Dr. Breuder.	3.50
	KTS	Communication with counsel and client team re: media coverage and response strategy surrounding public events at the College; call with counsel to discuss news coverage of legislation and state audit; drafting of media response for Daily Herald audit inquiry; communication to client re: media requests and response process.	4.50
<b>3/9/2015</b>	<b>JM</b>	<b>Consult with counsel on draft and offered comments on Chairman's proactive leadership memo.</b> Reviewed edits and spoke to counsel.	<b>1.50</b>
	KTS	Consult with counsel on media coverage; drafting of board memo and distribution strategy for client; <b>review of FOIA documents</b> .	3.50
<b>3/10/2015</b>	<b>JM</b>	Consult with counsel on ideas for <b>Chairman to provide proactive leadership.</b> <b>Numerous communications with counsel about Chairman's comments and thoughts regarding a proactive media plan.</b>	<b>2.00</b>

3/10/2015	SP	Consult with counsel on, meet with team, draft memo, background on FOIA and documents to be released in response	0.75
	GJC	Mult calls w/ counsel R. Vasquez and E.Birt; re: board; draft board memo; internal re: next steps	3.00
3/11/2015	JM	Consult with counsel on draft of materials regarding proposed Chairman's plan to create committees to review and rewrite COD policies. Numerous communications with counsel about Chairman's initiative.	4.50
	KTS	Consult with counsel, multiple calls w/counsel regarding release of memo calling for internal reviews, media strategy & messaging; revisions to drafted memos per client feedback.	4.50
	LL	Consult with counsel on revisions to memo, strategy meeting, draft memo for media release, follow up and next steps for media outreach.	4.00
	SP	Consult with counsel on RF, call with EB, call with RF, call with COD. Call with BB, call with TG. Memos. Back/forth with Tribune and Daily Herald	5.00
	GJC	multiple calls w/ counsel R. Vasquez re: drafted materials; internal discussion; memo review	2.00
3/12/2015	JM	Consult with counsel, meeting with representatives of COD. Prepared media strategy regarding upcoming Tribune and Daily Herald stories regarding the COD foundation.	4.00
	KTS	Consult with and approval of media responses with counsel; correspondence with Suburban Life, Daily Herald and Chicago Tribune re: multiple media inquiries re: state audit, Board memo on internal reviews	4.00
	LL	Consult with counsel on strategy, fielded media requests for information, outreach to Stacy St. Clair at Tribune and Robert Sanchez and Jake Griffin from Daily Herald regarding assessment and audit, calls with counsel re: approval of media statements, follow up re: request from Suburban Life.	4.00

3/12/2015	SP	Consult with counsel on Assessor issue. Board meeting agenda and calls. Press release from candidate and media requests for response. Calls from DH, Tribune on memo. Statement. Call with FR. Call with EB. Call with TG.	6.00
	GJC	Consult with R. Vazquez; internal re: media responses; Strategy discussion	2.50
3/13/2015	SP	calls with R. Vasquez; next steps, call with COD team, DH inquiry, back/forth on Trib inquiry	3.00
	KTS	Consult with and correspondence with counsel re: FOIA requests and responses; conference call with counsel to discuss status of inquiries, proactive media strategies, other updates.	4.00
	JM	Consult with counsel about Chairman's initiative to redraft COD policies regarding travel and expenses. Reviewed new FOIA responses and discussed strategy with client. Consult with counsel about material that RPG needed to prepare for upcoming media stories.	5.50
	LL	Consult with counsel, conference call to discuss next steps, incoming media requests for information, review materials for potential distribution to media.	3.00
	GJC	internal communications re: next steps	1.00
3/14/2015	KTS	Consult with counsel to discuss appropriate response to Daily Herald op-ed offer	1.00
3/15/2015	JM	Consult with counsel regarding numerous FOIA requests and media inquires. Reviewed dozens of FOIA responses.	3.50
	KTS	Consult with counsel, strategy conference call	0.50
	GJC	mult. internal communications; conference call w/ team; follow-up with counsel	2.00
3/16/2015	KTS	Consult with counsel and correspondence with counsel re: pending media requests; call with counsel to discuss 3/19 Board Meeting resolutions; votes; media angles.	1.00

3/16/2015	LL	Consult with counsel on media strategy, proactive communication opportunities.	0.50
3/17/2015	SP	Consult with counsel; meeting with COD on FOIAs, gathering of facts and data, backgrounding and providing information to RFV	2.00
	JM	Consult with counsel on draft of materials for Chairman regarding Thursday's Board meeting. Strategy regarding legislative request for an audit.	3.50
	KTS	Consult with counsel re: 3/19 meeting agenda; revisions to Q&A document for use during 3/19 Board meeting	2.00
	LL	Consult with counsel on proactive communication opportunities, update on incoming and outstanding media requests for information.	1.00
3/18/2015	JM	Consult with counsel on Board meeting agenda and researched agenda items. Drafted talking points for Chairman; Drafted statement regarding alcohol policy and spoke to counsel about the history of the alcohol policy; Reviewed Board of Director and staff bylaws regarding alcohol and other issues; Media inquiries about statements made by candidates for COD board.	6.50
	KTS	Consult with and correspondence with counsel re: media request from Daily Herald re: client retaining RPG for counsel; communication with Chicago Tribune re: media inquiry; follow-up call with counsel re: conversation with Chicago Tribune; review of FOIA requests.	4.00
	LL	Consult with counsel on suggested revisions on materials for potential distribution to media outlets including Chicago Tribune, Daily Herald and Suburban Life.	1.00
	SP	Consult with counsel on FOIAs, Tribune responses, call with Res, calls with COD team, call with Tribune, outreach by DH	1.75
	GJC	Consult with counsel; internal re: board meeting agenda, media management, next steps	1.00



3/19/2015	SP	Consult with counsel on FOIA responses, review and response, back/forth with Tribune, call with RFV	1.25
	JM	Consult with counsel and spoke to Tribune about a story regarding College's alcohol policy. Spoke to COD about the history of the alcohol policy regarding staff and board members.	1.50
	KTS	Consult with counsel re: media response to Daily Herald re: retaining RPG for counsel; correspondence with counsel re: response to Chicago Tribune re: alcohol policy at College;	3.50
	LL	Consult with counsel on incoming requests for information from media outlets including Tribune and Daily Herald, discuss outgoing communications.	1.00
	GJC	Internal discussion re: FOIA's, Chairman's statement and next steps	2.00
3/20/2015	JM	Consult with counsel on IMET research and when COD removed the funds. Spoke with Tribune about Hurricane inquiries. Spoke with counsel about pending FOIA requests and current media inquiries.	3.50
3/23/2015	KTS	Outreach to Daily Herald re: media request to the College; consult with counsel re: media response strategy & process.	1.00
	JM	Consult with counsel on FOIA responses regarding Hurricane and talked to COD about their use of the AIA contracts. Drafted statements for counsel to issue to media.	2.50
	GJC	internal mtg re: media inquires and FOIA's	1.00
3/24/2015	KTS	Consult with counsel; facilitation of meeting for w/o 3/23	1.00
	JM	Consult with counsel on COD regarding story on Hurricane graphics. Reviewed invoices and FOIA responses and talked to counsel about response to media inquiries.	2.50
	SP	Tribune FOIAs - responses to be provided and review of those just filed, call with TG, call with counsel RFV, responses	1.25

3/25/2015	SP	Consult with counsel on two calls with TG, call with Tribune on IMET, back/forth with TG/JM on IMET, back/forth with counsel on responses, review all Tribune FOIA documents for responses, draft responses for Tribune on contracts	4.25
	KTS	Consult with counsel on FOIA responses; drafting of media responses re: Daily Herald inquiry on arts programs at the College; monitoring of legislative activity re: College in Springfield and drafting of media statement in event of inquiries.	2.50
	GJC	Consult with counsel on media outreach, internal re: FOIA's for Tribune, next steps	2.25
3/26/2015	SP	Consult with counsel on IMET responses, Tribune story, chasing answers to outstanding questions, Herculane questions, new batch of DH FOIAs to review, call with Counsel on FOIAs, ongoing issue of lack of documents available to media	3.25
	KTS	Review of FOIA responses with counsel; status call with client.	2.00
	GJC	Consult with counsel on media responses; FOIA's for Suntimes	1.00
3/27/2015	JM	Spoke to COD about Herculane graphics. Reviewed FOIA'd information regarding Herculane and consult with counsel about media inquiries.	2.00
	MAC	Meeting w/ counsel; discussion of various issues & strategy	3.00
	KTS	Consult with counsel on media, messaging and strategy meeting with counsel; calls/correspondence with Daily Herald re: story on Herculane Graphics; call with Suburban Life re: inquiry on Herculane Graphics.	5.00
	SP	Chicago Tribune story, meeting with Counsel, follow-up calls with Tribune, calls with TG, FOIAs, meeting on next story, outreach from DH after left	2.50
	GJC	Consult with counsel R. Vazquez and internal follow up	0.50

3/28/2015	JM	Consult with counsel on Tribune regarding possible story about COD enrollment numbers; Reviewed memo from former COD staff on enrollment and talked to counsel and administrators about the memo and related issues; Researched SLEA program.	2.50
3/29/2015	JM	Consult with counsel on Sunday and on numerous calls with COD administrators, attorneys and Tribune reporters regarding two stories. First story was about increases in the college credit awarded to some CE classes; Second story involved grand jury subpoenas. Reviewed and drafted responses and coordinated efforts to gather information.	5.50
3/30/2015	JM	Consult with counsel and phone calls with administrators about enrollment numbers. Participated in an interview with the Tribune and COD about enrollment policy. Drafted media responses for various issues; Drafted proactive media ideas for college credit issues.	4.50
	AM	Consult with counsel on correspondence with WBEZ producer re: COD, investigation; sent statement	0.50
	KTS	Consult with counsel on Daily Herald re: inquiry on College expenditures; media response to counsel for approval; to publication for use.	2.00
3/31/2015	JM	Consult with counsel; administrators regarding college credit story; proposed a proactive solution. Spoke to the tribune multiple times; Send FOIA'd grand jury subpoenas to Tribune and spoke to reporters; Responded to inquires from the Daily Herald and NPR.	4.50
	KTS	Consult with counsel on communications with Suburban Life re: Hurricane Graphics inquiry; correspondence with counsel re: discussions about College on Politics Tonight; fielding of media requests from Daily Herald re: subpoenas	2.00

